
MONROE CITY SCHOOL BOARD 

MONROE, LOUISIANA 

“BID PROPOSAL FORM” 

SFS25-01 PAPER AND CLEANING SUPPLIES 

9:00 A.M. CST ON TUESDAY, JUNE 18, 2024 

 

 

ITEM 

 

SPECIFICATION 

 

QTY 

 

 

CENTRAL-

POLY 

 

 

ECONOMICAL 

 

 

HD 

SUPPLY 

 

 

INTERBORO 

PACKING 

 

 

PARKER 

WHOLESALE 

 

 

 

PYRAMID 

 

 

 

UNIPAK 

 

 

 

VCC 

100000 Apron, Bibbed 50 cs No Bid 23.40 No Bid No Bid 54.88 46.98 No Bid 58.13 

100006 Bag, Grocery Brown 6# 100 cs No Bid 13.29 No Bid No Bid 10.73 No Bid No Bid 12.50 

100035 Spork 400 cs No Bid 7.03 No Bid No Bid 12.50 8.89 No Bid 15.10 

100038 School Lunch Tray 5-Compartment 500 cs No Bid 24.95 No Bid No Bid 30.25 No Bid No Bid 29.42 

100044 Aluminum Foil 18" Roll 400 rl No Bid 24.63 No Bid No Bid 27.17 No Bid No Bid 28.19 

100046 PVC Film 18” Roll 100 rl 28.40 13.48 No Bid No Bid  19.62 No Bid No Bid 14.41 

100048 Pan Liners 16 3/8” x 24 3/8” 100 cs No Bid 43.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 46.90 

100050 Bun Pan Covers, Size 21” x 6” x 35” 50 cs 13.90 13.75 No Bid 13.82 15.77 No Bid No Bid 59.30 

100062 Paper Napkins, 10 x 17 200 cs No Bid 46.30 No Bid No Bid 44.10 No Bid No Bid 47.30 

100094 Stainless Steel Scrubber, Large 15 cs No Bid 4.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.59 No Bid 33.68 

100108 Bar Mop Towel 300 dz No Bid 5.07 No Bid No Bid 4.40 4.99 No Bid  27.40 

100122 Brute Rd 44 Gal Wheeled Container 80 ea No Bid 65.30 81.09 No Bid No Bid 58.99 No Bid 66.02 

100131 White Roll Towels 200 cs 39.99 27.60 48.95 No Bid 29.67 No Bid No Bid 43.67 

100133 Angular Sweep Broom 150 ea No Bid 3.10 8.98 No Bid No Bid 3.98 No Bid 3.25 

100139 Multi-Fold Hand Towels 300 cs 28.50 21.85 33.45 No Bid 24.14 No Bid No Bid 20.13 

100500 Bleach 300 cs No Bid 19.39 25.85 No Bid No Bid 26.98 No Bid  22.54 

100525 Industrial Nitrile Gloves 

Large (40 cases) 

Ex-Large (40 cases) 

80 cs  

No Bid 

No Bid 

 

33.25 

33.25 

 

32.55 

32.55 

 

23.20 

23.20 

 

30.54 

30.54 

 

36.90 

36.90 

UPC/NPF 

29.50/33.50 

29.50/33.50 

 

25.00 

25.00 

        SFS25-01QT     


